Errata published with G3/2011 at page 308

Errata: THE STAMP DUTY LAW (2010 REVISION) The Stamp Duty Regulations,
2009 which were published as Supplement No.1 with Extraordinary Gazette No. 93 dated
31st December 2009 amended the Schedule to the Stamp Duty Law (2007 Revision).

These amendments were inadvertently omitted from the Stamp Duty Law (2010
Revision) published as Supplement No. 10 with Gazette No. 24 dated 22nd November
2010.

That omission is to be rectified as follows:

1. Under the heading “ATTORNEY, POWER OF” delete “$25” and substitute
“$50”.

2. Under the heading “DEED of any kind whatsoever” delete “$25” and substitute
“$50”.

3. Under the heading “MORTGAGE”- (a) in paragraph (c) delete “$30” and
substitute “$50”; and (b) in paragraph (e) delete “$25” and substitute “$50”.

4. Under the heading “POLICY OF INSURANCE other than life insurance” delete
“$5” and substitute “$12 for each new or renewed policy of insurance other than life
insurance”.

5. Under the heading “WITHDRAWAL OF CAUTION?” delete “$25” and substitute
“$50”.

Subscribers are advised to make the necessary amendments to their copies of the
Stamp Duty Law (2010 Revision).



“THE STAMP DUTY LAW (2010 REVISION)

The Stamp Duty Regulations, 2009 which were published as Supplement
No.l with Extraordinary Gazette No. 93 dated 31% December, 2009
amended the Schedule to the Stamp Duty Law (2007 Revision). These
amendments were inadvertently omitted from the Stamp Duty Law (2010
Revision) published as Supplement No. 10 with Gazette No. 24 dated 22™
November, 2010.

That omission is to be rectified as follows-

l.

2.

Under the heading “ATTORNEY, POWER OF” delete “$25” and
substitute “$50”.
Under the heading “DEED of any kind whatsoever” delete “$25” and
substitute “$50”.
Under the heading “MORTGAGE”-
(a) inparagraph (c) delete “$30” and substitute “$50”’; and
(b) in paragraph (¢) delete “$25” and substitute “$50”.
Under the heading “POLICY OF INSURANCE other than life
insurance” delete “$5” and substitute “$12 for each new or renewed
policy of insurance other than life insurance”.
Under the heading “WITHDRAWAL OF CAUTION” delete “$25”
and substitute “$50”.

Subscribers are advised to make the necessary amendments to their copies of
the Stamp Duty Law (2010 Revision).”.



