(Price $ .80)

(iv) for "$6.50" appearing in paragraph (c) substitute "$6.70";
(v} for"$5.20" appearing in paragraph (d), substitute "$5.35";
(vi) for "$5.20" appearing in paragraph (e) substitute "$5.35";
(vii) for "$8.45" appearing in paragraph (f) substitute "$8.70";
in regulation 108(1) for "$2.60" substitute "$2.70";

in regulation 109(1)(c) for "$1.95" substitute "$2.00";

in regulation 109A —

() for "$3.25" and "$5.85" appearing in paragraph (1),
substitute "$3.35" and "$6.05" respectively;

(i) for "$1.95" and "$3.25" appearing in paragraph (2),
substitute "$2.00" and "$3.35" respectively;

in regulation 109B for "$32.50", "$84.50", and "$4.05"

()
substitute "$33.50", "$87.25", and "$4.20" respectlvely,

0

regulation 114(4) is amended —

() by substltutlng "$500.00" for "$250.00" appearing in the
provision for "crane services, per crane, per annum";

(i) by adding the following as paragraph (6) of the regulation
“(6) The fees for ship to shore passenger service shall be
as follows —

() where the vessel is 60 feet or less, $25.00 per
boat per day;

(i) where the vessel is over 60 feet, $30.00 per
boat per day.".

Made in Council this 27th day of August, 1991.

MONA N. BANKS-JACKSON
Clerk of Executive Council

CAYMAN ISLANDS

Supplement No. 2 issued with Extraordineg Gazette dated Monday, 2nd
September, 1991.

THE PORT (AMENDMENT) REGULATIONS 1991.




CAYMAN ISLANDS

THE PORT AUTHORITY LAW
THE PORT (AMENDMENT) REGULATIONS 1991.

In exercise of the powers conferred upon the Governor in Council by

section 13 of the Port Authority Law, the following regulations are made —

Citation and 1. These regulations may be cited as the Port (Amendment)
commencement. Regulations 1991, and shall come into force on the fifteenth day of
September, 1991.

ﬁ?ﬁg&ﬁt ofthe Port 2 The Port Regulations are amended in the following respects —

(321 in regulation 101, for "$25.00" and "$40.00" appearing in the
6th and 7th lines, substitute "$50.00" and "$80.00" respectively;

(b) in regulation 103, substitute "$35.00" for "$20.00";

(c) in regulation 105(2) for "4 cents", "3 cents", "20 cents”, and "15
cents"’, substitute "8 cents", "6 cents’, "40 cents", and "30 cents"
respectively;

(d) inregulation 106(4), for "$3.25" substitute "$3.35";

(e) inregulation 107 —

(i) for "$13.00" appearing in paragraph (a)(i) substitute
o "$13.40%

(g) for "$9.10" appearing in paragraph (a)(i) substitute
"$9.40";

(i) for "$10.40" appearing in paragraph (b) substitute
“$10.70";

oo
piiT



